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RODRIGUES REGIONAL ASSEMBLY 

Executive Council 

 
MAIN DECISIONS 

 
EXECUTIVE COUNCIL MEETING - FRIDAY 19 MARCH 2021 

 

The Executive Council met today under the chairmanship of  
the Chief Commissioner, Mr. Louis Serge CLAIR, GCSK  

 

1. The Executive Council has taken note of the time table for examinations for 
Primary School Achievement Certificate (PSAC), National Certificate of 
Education (NCE) and Cambridge Examinations 2021 and the arrangements 
being made to convey all papers to Rodrigues under strict sanitary control. 

The Primary School Achievement Certificate (PSAC) Assessment has now 
been scheduled from 06 to 09 April 2021. 

2. The Executive Council has agreed that the Commission for Education 
reviews the items being provided under the School Feeding Project as from 
academic year 2021/2022.  

3. The Executive Council has agreed that the Commission for Agriculture 
provides a subsidy to the Rodrigues Trading and Marketing Company Co. 
Ltd (RTMC) for the sale of onion, garlic and potato seeds to planters during 
the Seed Campaign 2021. 

4. The Executive Council has taken note that the Commission for Water 
Resources is launching bids for the construction of a 1000m3 concrete 
circular reservoir at Montagne Goyaves. 

5. The Executive Council has taken note of the outcome of the Rodrigues 
Transport Committee held on 10 and 11 December 2020. 
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6. The Executive Council has taken note of the activities being organised to 

mark the International Forest Day 2021 which is celebrated on 21 March 
2021. 

7. The Executive Council taken note that the representatives of Regional 
Sports Committees in Rodrigues will participate in a “stage de formation des 
préparateurs mentaux et préparation physique spécifique” being organised 
by the Ministry of Youth Empowerment, Sports and Recreation and the 
Secretariat of the Commission Jeunesse et Sports de l'océan Indien (CJSOI). 

8. The Executive Council has taken note that the Commission for Sports is 
launching bids for the upgrading of Roseaux Football Ground. 

 
 
 
Chief Commissioner’s Office 

        Port Mathurin 
        Rodrigues 

Date: 19th March 2021 


